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https://canvas.colorado.edu/
mailto:alpna.bhatia@colorado.edu
https://canvas.colorado.edu/
https://canvas.colorado.edu/
https://canvas.colorado.edu/


https://canvas.colorado.edu/courses/64124
https://canvas.colorado.edu/courses/64124
https://canvas.colorado.edu/courses/64124
https://www.mheducation.com/highered/product/money-banking-financial-markets-cecchetti-schoenholtz/M9781260226782.html
https://libguides.colorado.edu/databaseguide/wallstreetjournal/home
https://libguides.colorado.edu/databaseguide/newyorktimes


https://community.canvaslms.com/t5/Student-Guide/How-do-I-set-my-Canvas-notification-preferences-as-a-student/ta-p/434


 



https://proctorio.com/support#minReqs
/registrar/students/records/ferpa
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account. Sometimes email gets lost (goes into spam), or slips my notice, so if you have not heard 
back from me in 2 days, do not hesitate to send another email.  
 
PHONE: This is my cell phone number. Call, or text me anytime between 10 am – 7 pm MST.  IF I don’t 
answer, leave a message or send a text regarding when it is a good time to get a hold of you and I will call 
you back. Realize that all questions cannot be answered over the phone and I may ask to meet with you 
(on zoom) anyways.  
 
COURSE POLICIES 
POLICY ON DUE DATES 
It is your responsibility to turn in each assignment on the required date. In general, there are NO 
EXTENSIONS. I will drop the lowest of your grades:1 model prep, 1 problem set, and 1 
exercise/discussion. So, you can miss a whole week and still be ok. The exceptions I may consider are 
sickness, university excused function, military service or circumstances beyond the students’ control. I 
reserve the sole right to determine what grounds constitutes a reasonable excuse for missing or submitting 
a late work assignment, and the right to require the student to submit proper verification of such excuse.  
 
CLASS BEHAVIOR 
Both students and faculty are responsible for maintaining an appropriate learning environment in all 
instructional settings, whether in person, remote or online. Those who fail to adhere to such behavioral 
standards may be subject to discipline. Professional courtesy and sensitivity are especially important with 
respect to individuals and topics dealing with race, color, national origin, sex, pregnancy, age, disability, 
creed, religion, sexual orientation, gender identity, gender expression, veteran status, political affiliation or 
political philosophy.  For more information, see the policies on 

http://www.colorado.edu/policies/student-classroom-and-course-related-behavior
/sccr/sites/default/files/attached-files/2019-2020_student_code_of_conduct_0.pdf
/sccr/sites/default/files/attached-files/2019-2020_student_code_of_conduct_0.pdf
/disabilityservices/
/disabilityservices/
mailto:dsinfo@colorado.edu
http://www.colorado.edu/disabilityservices/students/temporary-medical-conditions
mailto:honor@colorado.edu
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policy will be subject to nonacademic sanctions from the Honor Code as well as academic sanctions from 
the faculty member. Additional information regarding the Honor Code academic integrity policy can be 
found at the Honor Code Office website. 
Plagiarism is a form of academic dishonesty. Plagiarism is defined as the use of another’s ideas or words 
without appropriate acknowledgment. Examples of plagiarism include failing to use quotation marks when 
directly quoting from a source; failing to document distinctive ideas from a source; fabricating or inventing 
sources; and copying information from the Internet.  
 
SEXUAL MISCONDUCT, DISCRIMINATION, HARASSMENT AND/OR RELATED RETALIATION 
The University of Colorado Boulder (CU Boulder) is committed to fostering an inclusive and welcoming 

/osccr/honor-code
mailto:cureport@colorado.edu
https://cuboulder.qualtrics.com/jfe/form/SV_0PnqVK4kkIJIZnf
http://www.colorado.edu/institutionalequity/
http://www.colorado.edu/institutionalequity/
http://www.colorado.edu/policies/observance-religious-holidays-and-absences-classes-andor-exams
https://catalog.colorado.edu/undergraduate/credits-grading/
https://ce.colorado.edu/
https://ce.colorado.edu/
https://ce.colorado.edu/resources/topics/dates-and-deadlines-general-info/


 

mailto:help@colorado.edu
/pwr/writing-center
/counseling/
/counseling/
/libraries/
/healthcenter/coronavirus-updates/symptoms-and-what-do-if-you-feel-sick
/sccr/
/sccr/
/policies/covid-19-health-and-safety-policy
http://www.colorado.edu/policies/student-classroom-and-course-related-behavior
http://www.colorado.edu/osccr/
/protect-our-herd/how#anchor1
/protect-our-herd/how#anchor1
/protect-our-herd/daily-health-form
/protect-our-herd/daily-health-form
https://community.canvaslms.com/t5/Student-Guide/How-do-I-use-the-Calendar-as-a-student/ta-p/534
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